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Manistee County Road Commission
Summary of 2024 Bids for Hot Mix Asphalt (HMA) Paving and Patching Materials

(Materials are picked up by the MCRC at the Plant)
Bids Due:  2/28/2024

Bid Item #2 - Hot Mix Asphalt Paving and Patch Materials
Elmers Crane Rieth-Riley Ron Brown &

& Dozer Construction Sons, Inc.
(Traverse City) (Ludington) (Bear Lake)

Item Estimated Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Type of HMA Material Daily Quantity At the Plant At the Plant At the Plant
1 HMA, 13A 1 to 50 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid

51 to 100 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
101 to 150 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
151 to 200 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
201 to 250 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid

2 HMA, 36A 1 to 50 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
51 to 100 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
101 to 150 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
151 to 200 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
201 to 250 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid

3 HMA, LVSP 1 to 50 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
51 to 100 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
101 to 150 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
151 to 200 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
201 to 250 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid

4 HMA, 4EL 1 to 50 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
51 to 100 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
101 to 150 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
151 to 200 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid
201 to 250 tons $93.00 $78.50 No bid

5E1 or 5EL 31A Mix
5 HMA, Alternate Mixture 1 to 50 tons No bid $78.50 $93.00

Type Quoted 51 to 100 tons No bid $78.50 $93.00
101 to 150 tons No bid $78.50 $93.00
151 to 200 tons No bid $78.50 $93.00
201 to 250 tons No bid $78.50 $93.00
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Bid Item #2 - Hot Mix Asphalt Paving and Patch Materials
Elmers Crane Rieth-Riley Ron Brown &

& Dozer Construction Sons, Inc.

Plant Locations: Traverse City, MI Ludington, MI / Manton, MI Bear Lake, MI

Remarks:

N/A = Not Available

Notes:
1.  The Bidder shall provide the type and specifications for any alternate HMA mixtures with the bids for consideration by the Manistee County
      Road Commission (MCRC).
2.  The MCRC intends on purchasing these materials when they perform pavement repairs, pavement patches, wedging, and other work activities
     that require HMA mixtures.
3.  MCRC will need to consider project site locations and needs when deciding where to purchase the HMA materials and verify if the plants are
     producing material on the specific days needed.  MCRC trucking costs are a main consideration when determining where to purchase the materials.
     Will likely purchase the HMA materials from Ron Brown & Sons when HMA is needed for routine pavement patching of large potholes using our
     2 ton capacity hot patchers (subject to their current HMA material prices).

The 2024 HMA Paving and Patching Materials were awarded to all three of the bidders during the
Manistee County Board of County Road Commissioners regularly scheduled Board Meeting on March 13, 2024
MCRC staff will decide where to purchase the HMA materials based on the MCRC needs, projects, 
type of materials needed, and the project locations in the best interest of the MCRC

Summary By:  SKI Date:  2/29/2024
Checked By: JAP Date: 3/1/2024
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