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Manistee County Road Commission

Summary of 2024 Bids for Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene (CPE)

Culvert Pipe and Corrugated Plastic Underdrain Tubing

Bids Due: 2/28/2024

Bid Item #5 - Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe Culverts

St. Regis Culvert

Etna Supply

ADS

Inc.

Company

Round Pipe

(Charlotte, Ml)

(Traverse City, Ml)

(Rose City, MI)

1. Smooth-lined CPE Soiltight Culvert Pipe with Bell & Spigot Joints (Lineal Foot)

12" Diameter No bid $9.36 $5.88
15" Diameter No bid $13.37 $8.18
18" Diameter No bid $18.19 $11.87
24" Diameter No bid $29.42 $19.26
30" Diameter No bid $40.12 $27.81
36" Diameter No bid $51.35 $37.26
48" Diameter No bid $196.90 $80.23

2. Smooth-lined CPE Culvert Pipe with Plain Ends (Lineal Foot)
12" Diameter No bid No bid $5.88
15" Diameter No bid No bid $8.18
18" Diameter No bid No bid $11.87
24" Diameter No bid No bid $19.26
30" Diameter No bid No bid $27.81
36" Diameter No bid No bid $37.26
48" Diameter No bid No bid $80.23

3. Split Couplers for Smooth-lined CPE Pipe with Plain Ends (Each)
12" Diameter No bid $8.44 $8.44
15" Diameter No bid $23.25 $15.00
18" Diameter No bid $23.95 $23.95
24" Diameter No bid $33.78 $33.78
30" Diameter No bid $78.53 $78.53
36" Diameter No bid $109.26 $109.26
48" Diameter No bid $310.88 $250.00

4. Corrugated Perforated Plastic Tubing with Geotextile Wrap for

Underdrain (Lineal Foot)

6" Diameter No bid No bid $1.21
8" Diameter No bid No bid $3.10

5. Split Couplers for Corrugated

Plastic Tubing for Underdrain (Each)

(External Split)

6" Diameter

No bid

No bid

$5.30

8" Diameter

No bid

No bid

$7.26
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Summary of 2024 Bids for Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene (CPE)

Culvert Pipe and Corrugated Plastic Underdrain Tubing

Bids Due: 2/28/2024

Bid Item #5 - Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe Culverts

St. Regis Culvert

Etna Supply

ADS

Inc.

Company

Round Pipe (Charlotte, MI) (Traverse City, Ml) (Rose City, MI)
Terms of Sale: None Net 30
Discounts: None

Shipping Charges:

Firm Price:

4/1/2024-3/31/2025

4/1/2024-3/31/2025

Miscellaneous:

Warranty on manufacturing

defects

The 2024 Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe (CPE) Culvert and Corrugated Plastic Underdrain

Tubing was awarded to Etna Supply and ADS during the Manistee County Board of County Road

Commissioners regularly scheduled Board Meeting on March 13, 2024.

The MCRC will place orders based on the bids, volumes needed, shipping charges (if any), pricing at

time of order and what is in the best interest of the MCRC.

The compatability of materials (joints & couplings) will also be considered as the MCRC currently has

Advance Drainage Systems materials in stock.

Summary By: SKI

Date: 2/29/2024

Checked By: JAP

Date: 3/1/2024

C:\Users\Jess\Desktop\MCRC\Bids\FY 2024\Annual\Tabulations\Final\[3-13-24 Cold Patch Pavt Patching Bids.xIsx]ltem 4 Corr Gal Pipe




	Item 5 Corr Poly Pipe

