Manistee County Road Commission

Summary of 2022 Bids for Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene (CPE)

Culvert Pipe and Corrugated Plastic Underdrain Tubing

Bids Due: 4/04/22 (Re-bid from 2/28/22)

Bid Item #5 - Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe Culverts

Advance Drainage

Vandervelde

Systems, Inc.

Sales

Round Pipe

(Rose City, MI)

(Weidman, MI)

1. Smooth-lined CPE Soiltight Culvert Pipe with Bell & Spigot Joints (Lineal Foot)

N-12 Equivalent MDOT Approved

Bell & Spigot

12" Diameter $7.46 $7.36
15" Diameter $9.13 $9.47
18" Diameter $13.25 $14.29
24" Diameter $22.36 $23.48
30" Diameter $33.13 $35.39
36" Diameter $41.58 $45.65
48" Diameter No Bid $73.57

2. Smooth-lined CPE Culvert Pip

e with Plain Ends (Lineal Foot)

Plain End Pipe is not an MDOT

Product

12" Diameter No Bid $7.36
15" Diameter No Bid $9.47
18" Diameter No Bid $14.29
24" Diameter No Bid $23.48
30" Diameter No Bid Not Available
36" Diameter No Bid Not Available
48" Diameter No Bid Not Available
3. Split Couplers for Smooth-lined CPE Pipe with Plain Ends (Each)
12" Diameter $13.45 $9.75
15" Diameter $22.41 $13.80
18" Diameter $38.19 $19.40
24" Diameter $53.86 $33.82
30" Diameter $125.20 $54.60
36" Diameter $174.20 Not Available
48" Diameter No Bid Not Available
4. Corrugated Perforated Plastic Tubing with Geotextile Wrap for
Underdrain (Lineal Foot)
6" Diameter $1.70 $1.90
8" Diameter $9.27 $3.53

5. Split Couplers for Corrugated

Plastic Tubing for Underdrain (Each)

Internal Couplers

6" Diameter

$6.75

$4.23

8" Diameter

$8.90

$4.52

"Bold" = Low Bid
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Manistee County Road Commission

Summary of 2022 Bids for Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene (CPE)

Culvert Pipe and Corrugated Plastic Underdrain Tubing

Bids Due: 4/04/22 (Re-bid from 2/28/22)

Bid Item #5 - Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe Culverts

Advance Drainage Vandervelde
Systems, Inc. Sales
Round Pipe (Rose City, MI) (Weidman, M)
Terms of Sale: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
Discounts: None shown None shown
Shipping Charges: None Listed 1/2 Truckload Minimum
Included with Bid for Free Shipping

(Per MCRC Bid Spec)

Firm Price: 4/01/22 - 3/31/2023 Pricing includes current surcharges

(Per MCRC Bid Spec) and could change at any time

based on market conditions

Please call before placing

order

Miscellaneous: One Year Limited Warranty

The 2022 Smooth-lined Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe (CPE) Culvert and Corrugated Plastic Underdrain

Tubing was awarded to both bidders during the Manistee County Board of County Road Commissioners

regularly scheduled Board Meeting on April 13, 2022. \

The MCRC will place orders based on the bids, volumes needed, shipping charges (if any), pricing at

time of order and what is in the best interest of the MCRC. \

The compatability of materials (joints & couplings) will also be considered as the MCRC currently has

Advance Drainage Systems materials in stock.

Summary By: MPS Date: 4/04/22

Checked By: JAP Date: 4/05/22
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