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Manistee County Road Commission

Summary of 2021 Bids for Corrugated Aluminized Steel Pipe Culvert

Bids Due: 3/01/21

Bid Item #3 - Corrugated Aluminized Steel Pipe Culvert

1. Aluminized Type 2 Steel Culverts (Lineal Foot)

Round Pipe Cadillac Culvert St. Regis Culvert Jensen Bridge & Supply Co.
2-2/3" x 1/2" Corrugations

12" Diameter, 16 gage Need to Quote Aluminized $9.80 $9.78
15" Diameter, 14 gage Pipe on a "Job x Job Basis" $14.70 $14.78
15" Diameter, 16 gage $11.76 $12.00
18" Diameter, 14 gage $17.65 $17.72
24" Diameter, 14 gage $24.00 $23.67
24" Diameter, 16 gage $19.00 $19.10
30" Diameter, 14 gage $33.00 $29.46
36" Diameter, 14 gage $39.60 $34.99
48" Diameter, 12 gage $78.00 $67.75
48" Diameter, 14 gage $60.00 $51.16
60" Diameter, 10 gage $153.40 $105.52
72" Diameter, 10 gage $182.00 $131.78

Arch Pipe
17" x 13", 14 gage Need to Quote Aluminized $16.95 $16.25
21" x 15", 14 gage Pipe on a "Job x Job Basis" $20.30 $19.49
28" x 20", 14 gage $27.60 $26.04
35" x 24", 12 gage $46.25 $32.41
42" x 29", 12 gage $59.17 $51.72
57" x 38", 12 gage $89.70 $74.53
71" x 47", 10 gage $176.45 $116.07
83" x 57", 10 gage $209.30 $144.96
2. Mitered Ends (Each)

Round Pipe
48" Diameter, 12 gage Need to Quote Aluminized | Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $265.78
48" Diameter, 14 gage Pipe on a "Job x Job Basis" | Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $265.78
60" Diameter, 10 gage Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $356.21
72" Diameter, 10 gage Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $431.57

Arch Pipe
42" x 29", 12 gage Need to Quote Aluminized Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $225.36
57" x 38", 12 gage Pipe on a "Job x Job Basis" | Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $265.78
71" x 47", 10 gage Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $356.21
83" x 57", 10 gage Dependent on Slope Call for Pricing $431.57

3. Bands (Each)

Dimpled Bands (Each)

12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia.

Need to Quote Aluminized

1.65 x per foot price

1.75 x per foot price

24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia.

Pipe on a "Job x Job Basis"

2.50 x per foot price

2.25 x per foot price

Angular Bands (Each)

12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia.

Need to Quote Aluminized

1.65 x per foot price

1.75 x per foot price

24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia.

Pipe on a "Job x Job Basis"

2.50 x per foot price

2.25 x per foot price

"Bold" = Low Bid
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Bid Item #3 - Corrugated Aluminized Steel Pipe Culvert

Cadillac Culvert St. Regis Culvert Jensen Bridge & Supply Co.

4. Re-rolled Spiral - Pipe End, 12" (Each)

12" to 24" Diameter No Bid No Charge No Bid

24" to 72" Diameter No Bid Add 5% No Bid

5. End Sections (Each)

End Section - Round Pipe (Each)

Galvanized Galvanized
15" Diameter, 16 gage $48.00 Special Order call for Pricing $50.00
18" Diameter, 16 gage $62.00 Special Order call for Pricing $60.00
24" Diameter, 16 gage $100.00 Special Order call for Pricing $90.00
End Section - Arch Pipe (Each)
Galvanized Galvanized
21" x 15", 16 gage $62.00 Special Order call for Pricing $60.00
28" x 20", 16 gage $100.00 Special Order call for Pricing $90.00
35" x 24", 14 gage $210.00 Special Order call for Pricing $210.00
42" x 29", 14 gage $300.00 Special Order call for Pricing $305.00
Discounts: 1% if paid w/in 10 Days None 1% if paid w/in 10 Days
Terms of Sale: 1% 10 Days - Net 30 Net 30 Days 1% 10 Days - Net 30
Shipping Charges: Prices include full truck None Indicated in Bid No Shipping Charges

delivery to yard or jobsite

Freight charges may apply

to loads less than truck load

Firm Price: Prices firm for 60 days 30 Days from bid date 60 Days from bid date

Prices will be reviewed

after 60 days for possible

increase or decrease due

to current steel market

conditions

"Bold" = Low Bid

Miscellaneous: All materials meet or exceed All materials meet or exceed All materials meet or exceed
MDOT specifications MDOT specifications MDOT specifications

The 2021 Corrugated Aluminized Steel Pipe Culvert materials was awarded to Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. during the

Manistee County Board of County Road Commissioners regularly scheduled Board Meeting on March 10, 2021

Summary By: JAP Date: 3/2/21

Checked By: MPS Date: 3/4/21
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